NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:		E C D D E	PROCUREMENT DI	VISION		PA - 029-23	OPENING TIME
3		GU.		NH123	D:CO q.m		
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES:		MR 10 SC		71.16.2			
Trash, Wood, and Cardboard Removal Services							
	DESCRIPTION	maisman.	B. Dededo Warehouse	C. Tenjo Vista Pour Mant	AMERITANA	200	5775/8
	QTY.	A. Degrad Power Plant	D-Deardo Warenowe	C. VENYO VISTA PARE TRANT	D. THE DESET PROPER P	ant e Labour	Compound
	UNIT	LOT	LOT	Lor	LOT	LOT	
Blogs	DELIVERY						
No.:[] Vendor Name: Lagu Sonitation		N-316-18	B.1- 17.00	C.1- 316.78	D-1- 316.78	E.1- 316	18
Bound Paper Original Oty.	Contract Contract	A.2- 273.00	B.2- (36.00	0.2- 273.00	D.2-273.00	E2- a7:	
		A3- 17.00	B3- no Bid	0.3- 17.00		E.3-17	
Mild GUARANTEE:		A.4-36.00	8.4- no bid	C.4- 36.00		E 4-36	
Weld Bond #: KDC • 15949-B Amount: \$ 152 Wentificate of Authority Wester of Attorney		A.5-no Bid	10.1				
A Certificate of Authority Lifeower of Attorney		A.6- NO Bid					
[] Standby Letter of Credit # Amount \$		1.0					
[] Letter of Credit # Amount \$	(A) 1 (E) 1				CALL SALES AND SALES	Mary Mary Mary	
[] Cashler's or Certified Check # Amount \$	3						
[] Wire Transfer	100						
[]/Affidavits (Original Form)							
[] Affidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with	-		10000000		 		-
(1) Ownership & Interest Disclosure (1) Non-Collusion (1) Wo Gratuities or Kickbacks	1	-			+		_
[Jethical Standards] Wage Determination [Mestriction Against Sex Offendors	-						
[] Business License [] Contractors License			-				
Chocal Procurement Signed and Submitted			Control of the Contro			-	
[] Literature	Bit in the last	K STATE OF THE STA	MARKET LANGUE TO A				

SIGNATURE

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:

Only Bid Other Than Lowest Responsive Bidder

INVITATION NUMBER:

NAMES OF PE	NAMES OF PERSONS PRESENT AT THE BID OPENING AND WHOM THEY REPRESENT								
PRINT NAME:	COMPANY NAME:	SIGNATURE:	DATE:						
1 Jackie Costro	Lagu Sanitation	radoca	(3/14/RD)						
2 aimee clark	Lagy Sanitation	web ex	9/4/03						
3 Jamie Lynn Pangerinan	6PA	weber	SIMPS						
4 Rose Marine	Morrico		3/14/20						
5 BETY JO CRUZ	Pacific Waste Systems, LC	Sta Jo Guz	3/14/22						
6			39-72-53						
7	00								
8	10								
9		11 141 14							
10	20,000								
11	300								
12									
13									
14		· Care is right							
15									
16									
17									
\8									
19	30 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 - 10 -								
20									
21									

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:	
NUMBER OF BIOS RECEIVED:	_
, 3	



PROCUREMENT DIVISION GUAM POWER AUTHORITY

OPENING DATE: OPENING TIME:

03 | 14 | 69 | 0:00 q.m -

ABSTRACT OF BIDS Continued

DESCRIPTION OF	SUPPLIE	S OR SERVICES		 -	
Trash Wood	and	Cardboard	Demorio	Samires	
	OP W	CAP IN COURT	POLICE	Syvius	

ans saruja	E Transch by Da	C Transmission & Distr	ibudia 11 Glania B. Nelson Au	blic T 3-1 3 31 (Hills the for To	विभागतीका स	ujita Piremala
ESCRIPTION	I OF	ahoma a · numborna	H. Service Building	olic I. Piti Power Plant LOT			
	W	LOI	LOT	LOT			
	Fi An Ox	0 1 00 001	11 1 100 11				
	F1-316.78	G.1- no Bid	H-1- 1633.66	I.1- 316.78			
	F.2- 273.00	G.2- no bid	H.2- 546.00	1.2-213.00			
	F.3- 17.00	B.3- 17.00	H.3- 17.00	I.3- 11.00			
<u> </u>	F.4-36.00	G.4-36.00	H.4- 36.00	I.4-36.80			
					*		
							
						 	
<u> </u>							
				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
					·		
						 	

personel supervision, and that the ruswes of all bidde -	Sers have been entered herete.	
TABLELATED BY: THURS	- CO (14) SO	₩ D

ī	3	Lowest Responsive Bidder
lč	Ž	Tie Bid
lt –	3	Only Bid
<u> </u>		Other Then Lowest Responsive Bidder

PAGE OF V

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:		WER			INVI	TATION NUMBER:	
AUMANTA OF PIDE SECTION	PROCUREMENT DIVISION					PA. 029-23	
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:			*** 0014/50 ****	LODIEV	OPE	NING DATE:	OPENING TIME:
(3)	,	GO.	AM POWER AUT	HORITY	D.a	114/23	10:00a.m/
	19	OFFER TO SERV	ABSTRACT OF B	IDS	_ 	114145	ID.QQ.MIT
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES:	7		ADSTRUCT OF D				
Trach, Wood, and Cardboard Removal Services							
		HZP (FRAM)	AMETTENIA	she from	sign (fakra		r Paredi
	DESCRIPTION	A Dadedo Pouter Plant	B. Dededo Warehouse	C. Tempo Vista Power Hand		A Plant E. Cabras	Compound
	QTY. UNIT	LOT	rol	LOT	Lot		lor'
	DELIVERY						
THOUGH .		A THE PARTY OF THE					
No.: [2] Vendor Name: Pacific waste Susterns, LLC	188	A1- 280.01	B-1- 205.98	C-1- 280:01	DI- 980.01	E-1- 98	50.01
Bound Paper Original Otty Bound Paper Copies Otty		1.2- 273.13	B.2. 64.20	0.2- 273.13	D.2-279.13	E.2- d	13.13
		A.3- 205.98	B.3-530.38	C3- 205.98	T	E3- d0	5.98
Weld GUARANTEE:		1.4- 64.20	B.4- 120.00	C.4- 64.80		E4- 6	
Weld Bond #: CKI-0005-GNB Amount: s 18,985.39		1.5- 530.38				3 (
Certificate of Authority Whower of Attorney		A.6- 120.00			†		
[] Standby Letter of Credit # Amount \$		n. v 100.00					
[] Letter of Credit # Amount \$				Condition of the Condit			
[] Cashier's or Certified Check # Amount \$	Action the present						
[] Wire Transfer	9						
Affidavits (Original Form)	-						
[] Affidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with							
Ownership & Interest Disclosure J Non-Collusion J No Gratuities or Kickbacks							
() Kinical Standards () Wage Determination () Restriction Against Sex Offendors		(A)					
[] Business License [] Contractors License		128 1-25					
Local Procurement Signed and Submitted		POSSESSED IN CONTRACT TO SERVICE SERVICE					
			Aug Lindburg and a few programs in a company of the	STREET, AND STREET, AND ARROWS BUILDING AT	AUDIORIUM DEPENDENCIES	portant forthead chicken like	

PAGE <u>3</u> OF <u>6</u>

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:

TABULATED BY: Duilyung

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:
3
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:



PROCUREMENT DIVISION **GUAM POWER AUTHORITY**

INVITATION NUMBER: GPA-029-23

03/14/20

OPENING TIME: 10:00a.m.

ABSTRACT OF BIDS Continued

Trash, Wood, and	Cardboard Pemora	l Sentes	ABSTRACT OF BIDS Continued					
WHI ZOUBLE	F. Transportation Company	UNESTERN A DESCRIPTION	WHEETEN S	(Marines) 4.	(B)C priprint	GNP HOW TO	culti ((65) n.e	
DESCRIPTION	F. Transportation Compound	6. Compound	H. Service Building	I. Piti Power Plant	,			
	LOT	LOT	lot	LOT				
	F.1-880.01	b.1- 530.38	H.1- 563.80	I.I- 180.01				
	F.2-293.13	G. 2- 1,195.05	H.2- 546.25	1.2- 273.13				
	E.3- 205.98	G.3- 205.98	H.3- 205.98	T.3- 205.98				
		G.4- 64.20	H.4- 64.20	T.4- 64.20				
·		<u> </u>						
•								

I hereby certify that all bids received to response to	o this faviliation were opened under my
personal supervision, and that the names of all bid	Mers have been enhanced hereix.
TABLES BY: Of Wilyungs	DATE: 314/03



NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:					INVITATION	NUMBER:	
3	,	PROCUREMENT DIVISION					<u> </u>
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:	- 6					ATE:	OPENING TIME:
3	GUAM POWER AUTHORITY					73	10:00a·m
		1410	ABSTRACT OF BI	DS			
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES:	\neg						
Trash, Wood, and Cardboard Removal Services						7	
	DESCRIPTION	A.Dudedo Power Plant	B Deleto Warehouse	C Tenio Vorta Power Plant	D. Vigo Dissel Power Head		Corrogand
	QTK Unit		[oT	LoT	LOT	LD	<i>T</i>
	UNIT						
Michigan	DELIVERY	The second states are	and the second state of the second		And the second second		
No.: [9] Vendor Name: MORRICO Equipment LLC		A.1- no Quote	B.1- no Quote	CI- NO QUOTE	D.1-10 Quote		Quote
Bound Paper Original Oty.		1.2- no avote	B.2- no Quote	C.2. no Quote	D.2- no Quote	F.2 10	Quo
		ha no Quote	B.3. 100.00	C.3- NO QUOTE		E.3-10	Quotes
WEID GUARANTEE: SD CIC - SUDID 80-1019 WEID BOND #: 649-69-39 Amount: \$ 1570		1.4 no Quote	B.4- 1,100,00	C4-10 Quote		E4-100	Quote
Meld Bond #: (3) 49 (3) 49 (3) Amount: \$ 10 (0)		A.5- 700.00					
Centificate of Authority [] Power of Attorney		A.G- 1,110.00					
[] Standby Letter of Credit # Amount \$		0.0000	The same of the sa				
() Letter of Credit # Amount \$	\$1555 CHES						
[] Cashier's or Certified Check # Amount \$	and the same of th						
[] Wire Transfer							
Affidavits (Original Form)							
() Affidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with	100 m						10.25
[] Ownership & Interest Disclosure J. Non-Collusion J. No Gratuities or Kickbacks	-		1				
Jethical Standards J. Wage Determination J. Restriction Against Sex Offendors	-	1		1			
Business License [] Contractors License	-						
Lacal Procurement Signed and Submitted	Control of the Contro						
[] Literature	4 504					SECTION .	
I hereby certify that all bids received in response to this invitation were opened under my personal supervision, and that the names of all bidders have been entered herein.					Lowest Responsive Bidder Tie Bid Only Bid Other Than Lowest Responsi		

PAGE ______ OF _____

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED: 3 NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 3 DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES: Trash, Wood, and Cardboard Pamoral Services			PROCUREMENT DIVISION GUAM POWER AUTHORITY ABSTRACT OF BIDS Continued			MUN NOTATIVNE DC Q - AQD STAG BONING CC 12 KQ	
Maring Vendon Vendon Vendon	STILL CHEMING	and or the same of	20007073238	2008/0760000	Onemeson:	CINCTIFIO FL	
DESCRIPTION	F. Transmetation Company	Transmission & Debrain	Gloria B. Helem Public H. Service Building	I. Piti Power Plant		NAME OF THE PARTY	
	LOT	LOT	LOT	LOT			
	FI- no Quote	B.1- 100.00	H.1-no Quote	II-no Quote			
	F.2-no Quote	G.2-1,110.00	H.2-no Quote	I.2- no Quote			
1	F.3-NO QUOTE	G.3- no Quote	4.3-no Quote	I.3- no Quote			_
,	F.4- no Quote	6.4-no Quote	H.4- NO QUOTE	I.4- no Quote			_
							_
c							
							_
1							_
		ļ					_
			_				_
	 	ļ. —					_
į	<u></u>						
		:		ļ			_
		ļ					_
							_
1		1					

5	100	THE RESIDENCE OF THE PARTY OF T
ıς	1	Lowest Responsive Bidder
II.	ŀ	The Rid
lt	- 3	Outy Bid
_عا	ì	Other Then Lowest Resconsive Blodte
		10 (0

10:00am